
 

 
 

Liberty and Recognition for Edward Snowden.  
Worldwide Reading on September 8th 2014 

 
 
The international literature festival Berlin (ilb) calls on all individuals, institutions, schools 
and media outlets that care about freedom and civil rights to participate in a worldwide 
reading of texts about surveillance in support of Edward Snowden, on 8th September 
2014. 
 
On 6th June 2103 the Guardian published the first of a long series of articles exposing 
the extent of mass surveillance being conducted by states and corporations worldwide, 
in particular the American National Security Agency (NSA) and the British intelligence 
agency Government Communications Headquarters (GCHQ). New information taken 
from the top-secret files of these agencies continues to be revealed, detailing how 
millions of innocent citizens are being digitally tailed as suspects. Data about our phone 
calls, online chats, text messages, web searches, social media use – all the means 
through which we daily conduct our lives – is collected, analyzed and stored.  
 
One man alone was responsible for disclosing these shocking violations to the public; 
his name is Edward Snowden. A former employee of the NSA, Snowden had become 
increasingly disillusioned and alarmed by the scope of surveillance and the illegal 
methods being used. He realized, “I do not want to live in a world where everything I do 
and say is recorded. That is not something I am willing to support or live under.” 
Unsuccessful attempts to influence the system from within pushed Snowden to take the 
only other route available to call attention to these gross infractions: whistleblowing. 
Knowing he might never again see his friends, family or country, Edward Snowden left 
his life and all comforts behind in the United States, carrying with him nothing except for 
four laptops within which were some of the National Security Agency’s most highly 
classified secrets.  
 
These leaks were shared with the world through careful collaboration with responsible 
newspapers. They have sparked a long overdue global debate about democracy and 
human rights in the digital age. Corporations have come under scrutiny for their brazen 
exploitation of consumers’ data. Citizens everywhere are waking up to the fact that 
there is no freedom without privacy and are demanding the right to live without being 
constantly observed. As a result, governments around the world are increasingly forced 
to review their own surveillance systems and, in some cases, acknowledge their 
complicity with the NSA.  
 
Edward Snowden disclosed his identity soon after the first leaks were published 
because he wanted to protect anyone else from being implicated. He said: “I have no 
intention of hiding who I am, because I know I have done nothing wrong.” The ilb 
wholeheartedly endorses this claim and asks all citizens to do so as well by joining in 
the worldwide reading for a man who has done humanity a great service. 



With this worldwide reading, we call on the United States Government to recognize that 
Edward Snowden's revelations are of essential importance for the safeguarding of 
democracy in the digital age, and thus that his actions must be seen to be covered by 
the Universal Unwritten Rule of the Ethical Right. Washington should therefore 
immediately lift all legal charges and complaints against Snowden, so that he can return 
home safely as a free man. 
 
We further demand that the Member States of the European Union, in recognition of the 
importance of his revelations, immediately grant Edward Snowden asylum in the EU, for 
as long as he may need it and at least until the US Government has lifted all charges 
against him. 
 
Finally, we ask that the Nobel Committee consider Edward Snowden for the Nobel 
Peace Prize – in recognition of his amazing, selfless service towards democracy, 
freedom and peace for all of us. 
 
All texts for the reading are available in several languages on July 30th on our website 
www.worldwide-reading.com. Please contact the ilb if you would like to participate. The 
email address is: worldwidereading@literaturfestival.com 
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